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Mumbai: At least 20 star-
tups will be blacklisted from
campus placements at the
premier IITs this year for
withdrawing their offers,
and 15 others will be warned
for going back on the prom-
ised offers or for deferring
their joining dates. The All-
India Placement Committee
(AIPC) of IITs which met
during the weekend at IIT-
Kanpur discussed possible
ways in which placements in
startups could be more
streamlined and monitored.
Startups will not get the
prime slots at the older IITs
either.

The two-day meeting

which concluded on Sunday
was attended by the profes-
sors in-charge of place-
ments at the IITs. “We divid-
ed startups which defaulted
during last year’s place-
ments in three categories —
the ones which delayed their
joining dates, ones which re-
duced their pay packets or
change the job profile and fi-
nally the ones which with-
drew their offers. While we
have decided to issue warn-
ings to the ones falling in the
first two categories, we will
be blacklisting the compa-
nies in the third category,”

said one of the professors
who attended the meeting. 

The startups will be
blacklisted for one year and
in the second year, if they
have to come back, they will
have to give a presentation
before the AIPC and then the
authorities would decide if
the decision has to be re-
voked, said the professor.

“We do not want to dis-
courage all IITs from invit-
ing startups, because a sec-
tion of students are still
keen on joining them. We
don’t want to lose startups
too, but there should be
some discipline in the proc-
ess. While the older IITs are
likely to stick to the policy,
we cannot force the newer
ones in Mandi, Bhubanes-
war, Indore, etc. The older
IITs will not be giving any of
them including Flipkart (e-
commerce giant), the day
one slot,” said a professor
from one of the older IITs.
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